Printed: 8/26/2021 10:18:47AM

Hancock County Sheriff's Office

By: mrsmith
Sales Listing
Scheduled 01/01/2020 through 12/31/2020
Sheriff # Sale Date Status Case # Property Parcel #
19001263 01/14/2020 Withdrawn 2019 F 00315 714 West Center Street Fostoria, OH 44830 540000146460
Date Rcvd Plaintiff Defendant Appr Date Appr Amt Dep Amt
10/28/2019 First Guaranty Mortgage Corp Sandra L Brown 11/01/2019 $68,000.00 $5,000.00
Sheriff # Sale Date Status Case # Property Parcel #
19001395 01/14/2020 Purchased - 3rd 2019 F 00311 129 South Meadow Drive McComb, OH 45858 410000107640
Party
Date Rcvd Plaintiff Defendant Appr Date Appr Amt Dep Amt
10/28/2019 First Federal Bank of the Midwest Logan M Harris 11/19/2019 $55,000.00 $5,000.00
Sheriff # Sale Date Status Case # Property Parcel #
19001396 01/14/2020 Purchased - 2019 F 00231 1808 Gayle Lane Findlay, OH 45840 570000217660
Plaintiff
Date Rcvd Plaintiff Defendant Appr Date Appr Amt Dep Amt
11/07/2019 loanDepot.com, LLC Joshua Miller 11/19/2019 $110,000.00 $5,000.00
Sheriff # Sale Date Status Case # Property Parcel #
19001504 01/14/2020 Purchased - 2019 F 00171 415 Central Avenue Findlay, OH 45840 580000241430
Plaintiff
Date Rcvd Plaintiff Defendant Appr Date Appr Amt Dep Amt
11/20/2019 The Huntington National Bank Janette A Ruffing, aka Janette 12/10/2019 $20,000.00 $5,000.00
Ruffing, Individually and as
Possible Heir to the Estate of
James J Ruffing, aka Jimmy J
Ruffing
Sheriff # Sale Date Status Case # Property Parcel #
19001092 01/28/2020 No Bid 18CVG03360 8176 Rockwood Drive Findlay, OH 45840
Date Revd Plaintiff Defendant Appr Date Appr Amt Dep Amt
08/22/2019 Fernco Development Ltd, DBA James Goble $11,790.00
Riverview Terrace Mobile Home
Park
Sale Time: 10:00 AM hancocksheriff.orq Contact: 419.424.7239 Page 1 of 8
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Hancock County Sheriff's Office

By: mrsmith
Sales Listing
Scheduled 01/01/2020 through 12/31/2020

Sheriff # Sale Date Status Case # Property Parcel #
19001093 01/28/2020 No Bid 19CVG00491 1828 Deer Ridge Drive Findlay, OH 45840
Date Rcvd Plaintiff Defendant Appr Date Appr Amt Dep Amt
09/06/2019 Fernco Development Ltd, DBA Judith Babb $22,890.00

Deer Ridge Mobile Home Park
Sheriff # Sale Date Status Case # Property Parcel #
20000039 02/18/2020 Withdrawn 2017 F 00312 3731 TR 142 Findlay, OH 45840 020001016050
Date Revd Plaintiff Defendant Appr Date Appr Amt Dep Amt
01/10/2020 J Steve Welton, Hancock County Timothy J Smith 01/14/2020 $165,000.00 $5,000.00

Treasurer
Sheriff # Sale Date Status Case # Property Parcel #
20000040 02/18/2020 Withdrawn 2019 F 00270 3111 Western Avenue Findlay, OH 45840 210001031334
Date Rcvd Plaintiff Defendant Appr Date Appr Amt Dep Amt
01/07/2020 CMG Mortgage Inc Matthew S Risser 01/14/2020 $90,000.00 $5,000.00
Sheriff # Sale Date Status Case # Property Parcel #
20000041 02/18/2020 Purchased - 3rd 2019 F 00426 8731 TR 94 Findlay, OH 45840 280001016481

Party

Date Rcvd Plaintiff Defendant Appr Date Appr Amt Dep Amt
12/31/2019 Mortgage Research Center, LLC Brent Lauer, aka Brent R Lauer 01/14/2020 $150,000.00 $5,000.00

d/b/a Veterans United Home

Loans, a Missouri Limited

Liability Company
Sheriff # Sale Date Status Case # Property Parcel #
20000043 02/18/2020 Withdrawn 2019 F 00357 421 Oakland Avenue Findlay, OH 45840 610000346250
Date Revd Plaintiff Defendant Appr Date Appr Amt Dep Amt
12/30/2019 Wells Fargo Bank, National Oscar Vazquez 01/14/2020 $25,000.00 $5,000.00

Association as Trustee for ABFC

2002-OPT1 Trust, ABFC

Asset-Backed Certificates, Series

2002-0OPT1

Sale Time: 10:00 AM hancocksheriff.orq Contact: 419.424.7239 Page 2 of 8
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Hancock County Sheriff's Office

By: mrsmith
Sales Listing
Scheduled 01/01/2020 through 12/31/2020

Sheriff # Sale Date Status Case # Property Parcel #
20000044 02/18/2020 Withdrawn 2019 F 00144 204 Marshall Street Findlay, OH 45840
Date Rcvd Plaintiff Defendant Appr Date Appr Amt Dep Amt
12/26/2019 PennyMac Loan Services, LLC Unknown Heirs, Legatees, 01/14/2020 $55,000.00 $5,000.00

Devisees, Executors,

Administrators and Assigns and

their Spouses, if any of Jack L

Mock
Sheriff # Sale Date Status Case # Property Parcel #
20000292 03/31/2020 Withdrawn 2019 F 00315 714 West Center Street Fostoria, OH 44830 540000146460
Date Rcvd Plaintiff Defendant Appr Date Appr Amt Dep Amt
01/28/2020 First Guaranty Mortgage Sandra L Brown $68,000.00 $5,000.00

Corporation
Sheriff # Sale Date Status Case # Property Parcel #
20000294 03/31/2020 Withdrawn 2019 F 00416 1905 North Main Street Findlay, OH 45840 570000218660
Date Rcvd Plaintiff Defendant Appr Date Appr Amt Dep Amt
02/14/2020 Select Portfolio Servicing, Inc Jill Morehart 02/25/2020 $82,500.00 $5,000.00
Sheriff # Sale Date Status Case # Property Parcel #
20000295 03/31/2020 Purchased - 2019 F 00222 116 North Main Street Jenera, OH 45841 500001025231
Plaintiff
Date Rcvd Plaintiff Defendant Appr Date Appr Amt Dep Amt
02/13/2020 The Citizens National Bank of Thomas E Shoemaker 02/25/2020 $25,000.00 $5,000.00
Bluffton

Sheriff # Sale Date Status Case # Property Parcel #
20000296 03/31/2020 Withdrawn 2019 F 00434 510 Swing Avenue Findlay, OH 45840 580000236780
Date Rcevd Plaintiff Defendant Appr Date Appr Amt Dep Amt
02/21/2020 The Huntington National Bank Evelyn J Goble, aka Evelyn Jean 02/25/2020 $35,000.00 $5,000.00

Goble

Sale Time: 10:00 AM hancocksheriff.orq Contact: 419.424.7239 Page 3 of 8
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Hancock County Sheriff's Office

By: mrsmith
Sales Listing
Scheduled 01/01/2020 through 12/31/2020
Sheriff # Sale Date Status Case # Property Parcel #
20000297 03/31/2020 Withdrawn 2019 F 00295 731 5th Street Findlay, OH 45840 580000246300
Date Rcvd Plaintiff Defendant Appr Date Appr Amt Dep Amt
02/07/2020 The Money Source Inc Austin W Cornette 02/25/2020 $82,500.00 $5,000.00
Sheriff # Sale Date Status Case # Property Parcel #
20000293 04/21/2020 Purchased - 3rd 2019 F 00249 103 North Scott Street Arcadia, OH 44804 530000135230
Party
Date Rcvd Plaintiff Defendant Appr Date Appr Amt Dep Amt
02/13/2020 J Steve Welton, Hancock County Jay C Benoit, Deceased 02/25/2020 $22,500.00 $5,000.00
Treasurer
Sheriff # Sale Date Status Case # Property Parcel #
20000430 04/21/2020 Withdrawn 2019 F 00425 722 West Fremont Street Fostoria, OH 44830 540000142050
Date Revd Plaintiff Defendant Appr Date Appr Amt Dep Amt
03/04/2020 Lakeview Loan Servicing LLC Susan A Allen 03/14/2020 $77,000.00 $5,000.00
Sheriff # Sale Date Status Case # Property Parcel #
20000432 04/21/2020 Withdrawn 2019 F 00439 522 West Center Street Fostoria, OH 44830 540000140780
Date Rcvd Plaintiff Defendant Appr Date Appr Amt Dep Amt
03/05/2020 KeyBank National Association Jose R Munoz Il 03/14/2020 $60,000.00 $5,000.00
Sheriff # Sale Date Status Case # Property Parcel #
20000434 04/21/2020 Withdrawn 2019 F 00435 310 East Foulke Avenue Findlay, OH 45840 600000291100
Date Revd Plaintiff Defendant Appr Date Appr Amt Dep Amt
03/03/2020 Navy Federal Credit Union Aaron J Crissman aka Aaron 03/17/2020 $30,000.00 $5,000.00
Crissman
Sheriff # Sale Date Status Case # Property Parcel #
20000435 04/21/2020 Withdrawn 2017 F 00421 1312 Park Street Findlay, OH 45840 570000214880
Date Rcvd Plaintiff Defendant Appr Date Appr Amt Dep Amt
03/04/2020 Fifth Third Mortgage Company Shawn M Jordan 03/17/2020 $60,000.00 $5,000.00
Sale Time: 10:00 AM hancocksheriff.orq Contact: 419.424.7239 Page 4 of 8
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Hancock County Sheriff's Office

By: mrsmith
Sales Listing
Scheduled 01/01/2020 through 12/31/2020
Sheriff # Sale Date Status Case # Property Parcel #
20000436 04/21/2020 Purchased - 3rd 2018 F 00272 0 CR 220 Van Buren, OH 45889 030001030104,
Party 020001028927
Date Rcvd Plaintiff Defendant Appr Date Appr Amt Dep Amt
02/25/2020 Cheryl Denny Buren Trace Development, LLC 03/17/2020 $50,000.00 $5,000.00
and Hancock County Treasurer
and The First National Bank of
Pandora
Sheriff # Sale Date Status Case # Property Parcel #
20000699 07/07/2020 Purchased - 3rd 2019 F 00324 430 West Center Street Fostoria, OH 44830 540000140900
Party
Date Rcvd Plaintiff Defendant Appr Date Appr Amt Dep Amt
05/26/2020 Isanthes, LLC Bryce E Dunbar, Administrator of 05/29/2020 $45,000.00 $5,000.00
the Estate of Eric Dunbar aka
Eric S Dunbar
Sheriff # Sale Date Status Case # Property Parcel #
20000700 07/07/2020 Purchased - 2019 F 00181 617 West Front Street Findlay, OH 45840 600000316280
Plaintiff
Date Rcvd Plaintiff Defendant Appr Date Appr Amt Dep Amt
05/01/2020 Citibank, N.A., as trustee for Mike K Brewster, aka Michael K $23,000.00 $5,000.00
CMLTI Asset Trust Brewster
Sheriff # Sale Date Status Case # Property Parcel #
20000701 07/07/2020 Withdrawn 2019 F 00040 15409 Bear Creek Court Findlay, OH 45840 350001014979
Date Rcvd Plaintiff Defendant Appr Date Appr Amt Dep Amt
05/22/2020 Aspen Properties Group, LLC as Elizabeth A Richards aka 06/02/2020 $240,000.00 $10,000.00
Trustee for Aspen G Revocable Elizabeth Richards
Trust
Sheriff # Sale Date Status Case # Property Parcel #
20000704 07/07/2020 No Bid 2020 F 00073 511 West South Street McComb, OH 45858 410000105510
Date Rcvd Plaintiff Defendant Appr Date Appr Amt Dep Amt
05/29/2020 J Steve Welton, Hancock County Timothy M Sigworth, Jr 06/02/2020 $5,000.00 $2,000.00
Treasurer
Sale Time: 10:00 AM hancocksheriff.orq Contact: 419.424.7239 Page 5 of 8
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Hancock County Sheriff's Office

By: mrsmith
Sales Listing
Scheduled 01/01/2020 through 12/31/2020
Sheriff # Sale Date Status Case # Property Parcel #
20000705 07/07/2020 Purchased - 2019 F 00144 204 Marshall Street Findlay, OH 45840 610000333350,
Plaintiff 610000333360
Date Rcvd Plaintiff Defendant Appr Date Appr Amt Dep Amt
05/28/2020 PennyMac Loan Services, LLC Unknown Heirs, Legatees, 06/02/2020 $42,000.00 $5,000.00
Devisees, Executors,
Administrators and Assigns and
their Spouses, if any, of Jack L
Mock
Sheriff # Sale Date Status Case # Property Parcel #
20000708 07/07/2020 Withdrawn 2019 F 00434 510 Swing Avenue Findlay, OH 45840 580000236780
Date Rcvd Plaintiff Defendant Appr Date Appr Amt Dep Amt
06/02/2020 The Huntington National Bank Evelyn J Goble $35,000.00 $5,000.00
Sheriff # Sale Date Status Case # Property Parcel #
20000874 08/25/2020 Purchased - 3rd 2020 F 00015 2116 Eagle Hill Court Findlay, OH 45840 570001012097
Party
Date Rcvd Plaintiff Defendant Appr Date Appr Amt Dep Amt
06/08/2020 The Huntington National Bank Shaun A Soisson 07/14/2020 $265,000.00 $10,000.00
Sheriff # Sale Date Status Case # Property Parcel #
20000909 08/25/2020 Purchased - 2019 F 00425 722 West Fremont Street Fostoria, OH 44830 540000142050
Plaintiff
Date Rcvd Plaintiff Defendant Appr Date Appr Amt Dep Amt
06/03/2020 Lakeview Loan Servicing LLC Susan A Allen $77,000.00 $5,000.00
Sheriff # Sale Date Status Case # Property Parcel #
20000910 08/25/2020 Purchased - 3rd 2019 F 00295 731 5th Street Findlay, OH 45840 580000246300
Party
Date Rcvd Plaintiff Defendant Appr Date Appr Amt Dep Amt
06/03/2020 The Money Source Inc Austin W Cornette $82,500.00 $5,000.00

Sale Time: 10:00 AM

hancocksheriff.org Contact: 419.424.7239

Page 6 of 8
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Hancock County Sheriff's Office

By: mrsmith
Sales Listing
Scheduled 01/01/2020 through 12/31/2020
Sheriff # Sale Date Status Case # Property Parcel #
20000911 08/25/2020 No Bid 2020 F 00073 0 West South Street McComb, OH 45858 410000105510
Date Rcvd Plaintiff Defendant Appr Date Appr Amt Dep Amt
07/02/2020 J Steve Welton, Hancock County Timothy M Sigworth, Jr $5,000.00 $2,000.00
Treasurer
Sheriff # Sale Date Status Case # Property Parcel #
20001188 10/06/2020 Purchased - 2019 F 00324 430 West Center Street Fostoria, OH 44830 540000140900
Plaintiff
Date Rcvd Plaintiff Defendant Appr Date Appr Amt Dep Amt
08/06/2020 Isanthes, LLC Bryce E Dunbar, Administrator of $45,000.00 $30,000.00
the Estate of Eric Dunbar aka
Eric S Dunbar
Sheriff # Sale Date Status Case # Property Parcel #
20001427 11/10/2020 Purchased - 3rd 2019 F 00434 510 Swing Avenue Findlay, OH 45840 580000236780
Party
Date Rcvd Plaintiff Defendant Appr Date Appr Amt Dep Amt
09/18/2020 The Huntington National Bank Evelyn J Goble $35,000.00 $5,000.00
Sheriff # Sale Date Status Case # Property Parcel #
20001590 12/08/2020 Purchased - 2020 F 00158 456 West North Street Fostoria, OH 44830 540000142950
Plaintiff
Date Rcevd Plaintiff Defendant Appr Date Appr Amt Dep Amt
10/23/2020 U.S. Bank Trust National Laurie J Sierra 10/31/2020 $70,000.00 $0.00
Association, Not in its Individual
Capacity but Solely as Owner
Trustee for REO Trust
2017-RPL1
Sheriff # Sale Date Status Case # Property Parcel #
20001592 12/08/2020 No Bid 2020 F 00262 435 Western Avenue Findlay, OH 45840 600000316910
Date Revd Plaintiff Defendant Appr Date Appr Amt Dep Amt
10/26/2020 J Steve Welton, Hancock County Edna P Aufrance, Deceased 11/03/2020 $5,000.00 $2,000.00
Treasurer
Sale Time: 10:00 AM hancocksheriff.orq Contact: 419.424.7239 Page 7 of 8
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Hancock County Sheriff's Office

By: mrsmith
Sales Listing
Scheduled 01/01/2020 through 12/31/2020

Sheriff # Sale Date Status Case # Property Parcel #
20001593 12/08/2020 Purchased - 3rd 2018 F 00142 118 West Edgar Avenue Findlay, OH 45840 560000184120

Party 560000184120
Date Rcvd Plaintiff Defendant Appr Date Appr Amt Dep Amt
10/30/2020 Cascade Funding Mortgage Trust Karen Trautman-Hayslip aka 11/03/2020 $190,000.00 $5,000.00

2017-1

Karen L Trautman-Hayslip

Sale Time: 10:00 AM

hancocksheriff.org Contact: 419.424.7239
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