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Dear Dr Evans 
 
Internal review of FOI 22/1079 
 
I am writing in response to your request of 9th July 2023 for an internal review of the 
Medicines and Healthcare products Regulatory Agency’s (‘the Agency’) response to your 
FOI request 22/1079. 
 
The purpose of this review is to determine whether the Agency dealt properly and fairly with 
your request under the Freedom of Information Act (FOIA).  
 
I will first set out the history of the request.  
 
Request history 
 
On 31st October 2022 you made the following request for information: 
 

1) The specific criteria that [MHRA] have set which will trigger a formal epidemiological 
study, in the context of COVID-19 vaccine safety monitoring.  

2) Any and all documents, emails, or minutes of meetings referring to rapid cycle 
analysis in the context of COVID-19 safety monitoring. 

3) Any and all documents, emails, or minutes of meetings referring to targeted active 
monitoring in the context of COVID-19 safety.  

4) Any and all documents, emails, or minutes of meetings that you relied upon to decide 
how many of these fatal outcomes were caused by a COVID-19 vaccine.  

5) The criteria that [MHRA] have set, regarding the number of reported COVID-19 
vaccine-associated deaths to the Yellow Card system, that would prompt you to call 
for a halt of the COVID-19 vaccination program.  

 



 

The Agency responded to your request on 16th June 2023 as follows: 
 

The MHRA does hold some of the information requested. However, we have also 
determined that the information is exempt under Section 12 of the Freedom of 
Information Act and we cannot process these requests further without refinement. 
Section 12 of the Act allows public authorities to refuse requests where the cost of 
dealing with them would exceed the appropriate limit, which for central government is 
set at £600. This represents the estimated cost of one person spending 24 working 
hours in determining whether the department holds the information, locating, 
retrieving, and extracting the information. The following requests would require the 
use of a Discovery Search Tool. Based on experience in using this tool to perform 
Agency-wide searches for information, the time taken to set up and refine the search 
criteria then extract and review the results to identify relevant records would take in 
excess of 24 hours: 

 
2) Any and all documents, emails, or minutes of meetings referring to rapid cycle 
analysis in the context of COVID-19 safety monitoring.  

3) Any and all documents, emails, or minutes of meetings referring to targeted active 
monitoring in the context of COVID-19 safety.  
 
Regarding question 1, there is no set criteria which would trigger a formal 
epidemiological study to investigate a safety concern with a COVID-19 vaccine, 
therefore the information is not held. However, as stated in the Report of the CHM 
Expert Working Group on COVID-19 vaccine Safety Surveillance, ‘[epidemiological 
studies] will be undertaken on an ad hoc basis should the need arise based on other 
vigilance activities.’ Considerations for whether an epidemiological study will be 
undertaken by the MHRA include whether a signal has been suggested by 
spontaneous reporting or enhanced passive surveillance (eg observed versus 
expected analysis or rapid cycle analysis), feasibility for MHRA to conduct an 
epidemiological analysis for the safety concern (based on whether and how the 
outcome may be captured in healthcare records data available to MHRA), and 
whether a study is already being undertaken by another regulator or other 
organisation.  
 
The MHRA also does not hold the information requested in question 4. While the 
MHRA carefully assesses Yellow Card reports with a fatal outcome to determine 
whether additional information is required to facilitate assessment of the link between 
a medicine and the reported adverse event, we do not assign causality (i.e. whether 
the patient’s death was caused by the vaccine) at the level of individual reports. 
MHRA considers data from Yellow Card reports, along with relevant information from 
other sources in their overall assessment of whether there may be a causal link 
between a medicinal product and an adverse event. Should a new link between a 
medicine and a safety concern be confirmed, the MHRA will take regulatory action, 
such as updating product information to include a warning for patients and healthcare 
professionals.  
 
Regarding question 5, please note that while the MHRA is the UK medicines 
regulator, responsible for ensuring that all medicinal products meet acceptable 
standards of quality, safety, and efficacy at the time of first authorisation and 



 

thereafter through continued monitoring, decisions about vaccination policy are not 
within the MHRA’s remit.  
 
For a vaccine to be considered acceptably safe, the benefits, or expected benefits 
must be greater than the risks of known harmful reactions. It is important to note that 
most people receive vaccinations without having any serious side effects. 

 
On 9th July 2023 you sought a review of this response.  
 
Issues on review 
 
In this internal review I have considered: 
 

• Use of the Section 12 FOIA exemption to withhold information in response to your 
requests 2 and 3 (as numbered above)  

• The completeness and wording of the responses provided to your requests 1,4, and 5 
 
Consideration of the issues 
 
I will address each of these points in turn. 
 

• Use of the Section 12 FOIA exemption to withhold information in response to your 
requests 2 and 3 (as numbered above)  

 
Section 12 of the FOIA allows a public authority to refuse to deal with a request where it 
estimates that it would exceed the appropriate limit.  
 
Both the rapid cycle analysis and targeted active monitoring were important components 
of the MHRA COVID-19 Vaccine Safety Surveillance Strategy (as detailed in the Report 
of the CHM Expert Working Group on COVID-19 vaccine Safety Surveillance for which a 
link was provided to you in the response of 16th June 2023). As such, considerable 
development work was undertaken prior to the introduction of the COVID-19 vaccines on 
the required methodologies and technical infrastructure involving multiple areas of the 
Agency and external partners and after the start of deployment where both approaches 
were actively implemented with the resulting data used to support ongoing monitoring of 
the safety of the vaccines.  
 
In applying Section 12 in this case consideration was given to the time, and associated 
costs, required to i) determine whether information was held, ii) locate the relevant 
information and documents, iii) retrieve the relevant information and documents, and iv) 
extract the relevant information and documents. I can confirm that as noted in the 
response the MHRA do hold relevant information. A search could be performed using a 
Discovery Search Tool with the search terms “rapid cycle analysis” and “targeted active 
monitoring”, alongside relevant synonyms, to locate and retrieve potentially relevant files. 
This could be refined by restricting to a period starting January 2020 to ensure capture of 
all files potentially relevant to the context of COVID-19 safety monitoring. However, the 
breadth of your request combined with the extent of use of the terms means that the 
volume of potentially relevant documents would be such that to both run the tool to 
retrieve them and to conduct the manual review required to ensure that information 



 

relevant to your request was extracted for you from them would easily exceed the 
threshold of 24 hours.  
 
I note your comment that “to claim that the MHRA cannot afford more than £600 in costs 
to allow full transparency to the public around their decision making and safety 
monitoring is appalling”. However, ICO guidance is clear that a single FOI request should 
not be allowed to cause a drain on time, energy, and finances to the extent that it 
negatively affects normal public functions, and it is my view that the breadth and scale of 
this request would require resource of a scale that there would be such an impact.  
 
The Information Commissioner Office advises that where a public authority claims section 
12 is engaged, it should, where reasonable, provide advice and assistance to help the 
requester to refine the request so that it can be dealt with under the appropriate limit. It is 
noted that in the response, MHRA noted that requests 2 and 3 could not be processed 
without refinement. However, no further guidance on that refinement was provided. As 
such I include advice on refining your requests in the next section of this review.    

 

• The completeness and wording of the responses provided to your requests 1,4, and 5 
 
In your email of 9th July where you sought a review of our earlier response you do not 
raise any specific issues with these responses. I have reviewed each and am satisfied 
that these responses are correct. However, further clarifying information may be helpful 
to you in response to requests 4 & 5 which I have provided below in the next section of 
this review.  

 
Conclusions and further information 
 
This internal review has identified that use of a Section 12 exemption was justified in this 
instance. The reasons for this have been expanded upon in this review. However, as noted 
insufficient advice was provided on how you could refine your request. As noted, the barrier 
to providing the information you request is the volume of documentation that could 
potentially be relevant and would therefore require manual review in order to identify if it 
included relevant information. A request covering a suitably short time period, with 
substantially more specific search terms, and/or restricted to a specified subsection of files 
e.g. minutes of a specific committee or meeting such as the CHM Vaccines Benefit Risk 
Working Group, may reduce the number of files to an extent that the required time would fall 
within the thresholds and the information would be provided subject to any necessary 
redactions.    
   
However, it should be noted that, when calculating the costs of complying with an FOI 
request, ICO guidance is that we can aggregate (total) the costs of all related requests for 
the same or similar information received within 60 working days from the same period or 
from people who appear to be acting together.  
 
To assist, I can also add some further explanation to our responses to request 4 and 5. Our 
response to request 4 correctly stated that while the MHRA carefully assesses Yellow Card 
reports with a fatal outcome to determine whether additional information is required to 
facilitate assessment of the link between a medicine and the reported adverse event, we do 
not assign causality. Adverse events, including events that are reported in temporal 
association with vaccines, occur naturally in the population at varying background rates. 



 

Therefore while individual case reports, including those with a fatal outcome, can provide 
important information to support the detection of unexpected or unanticipated risks 
attempting to assess of causality at an individual level from the report is rarely possible. 
Instead, an assessment of the body of evidence to determine if the rate of a particular 
adverse event is greater than that which would be expected due to the natural background 
rates and may therefore be associated, at a population level, with vaccination is required.  
 
In response to request 5, it should be additionally noted that, while decisions on the vaccine 
programme are not within our remit, as the UK regulator the MHRA are able to take action 
with regards to the licence of a vaccine.  
 
Finally, I can also advise that the MHRA are committed to publishing data from both the 
rapid cycle analyses and targeted active monitoring within peer reviewed journals and 
therefore information hopefully of interest to you will be available in these publications in the 
future.  
 
I hope that this review is useful for you and has further explained our position on the 
information you requested. 
 
If you remain dissatisfied, you may ask the Information Commissioner (ICO) to make a 
decision on whether or not we have interpreted the FOIA correctly in dealing with the request 
and subsequent internal review. The ICO’s address is: 
 
The Information Commissioner’s Office  
Wycliffe House 
Water Lane 
Wilmslow 
Cheshire 
SK9 5AF 
 

 
 
Dr Katherine Donegan  
Head of Epidemiology, Safety and Surveillance    
 
Medicines and Healthcare products Regulatory Agency 
 
 
 
 


